
1
Week beginning Monday Nov 13th

YEAR 10 REVISION TIMETABLE WINTER 2023
The Examinations Begin Monday 11th December 2023

Subjects & Topics

NAME

Monday

Tuesday

Wednesday

Thursday

Weekend

2
Week beginning Monday Nov 20th

Subjects & Topics

3
Week beginning Monday Nov 27th

Subjects & Topics

4
Week beginning Monday Dec 4th

Subjects & Topics
Religion

English 

Maths L7

French

Martin Luther King 

Revise structure of Personal 
and Creative Writing

Rules and Indices

Types of house and rooms

Religion

English

Maths L7

French

St Oscar Romero

Effective openings and endings

Percentages and Money

What you do in each room

Religion 

English 

Maths L7

Principles of Catholic social 
teaching 

Ambitious vocabulary (Word 
of the Week)

Sequences and the Nth term

Religion

English

Maths L7 
 

Irish

God and the Trinity

Mock paper

Transformations (reflections, 
rotations, enlargements and 
translations)

The Past Tense

Geography

Spanish

Maths M1 
M2

Irish

Global Tectonics

My interests (Somos así)

Number 

Holidays and the Gaeltacht

Geography

Spanish 

Maths M1 
M2

Irish 

Global Tectonics

Jobs and future plans 
(Oriéntate)

Sorting and Using Data 

Present tense (Rules, endings) 

Geography

Spanish 

Maths M1 
M2

Geography

HE

Maths M1 
M2

French

Megacities

Practising written answers in 
Spanish (both topics)

Scatter Diagrams

Megacities

Practical skills and routines

Venn Diagrams with 3 Circles

 
Sport, sport in past tense

Biology

HE

French

Gaels

Chemistry

Yr.9 Food & Digestion

Nutrients (Micro and Macro)

Furniture

Travel and tourism

Sect A: Atomic Structure 
and Periodic Table from Yr.9

Biology

HE

French 

Gaels 

Variation & Inheritance

Diabetes

Your opinion of your house 
and bedroom

Tourist information, weather, 
directions

Biology

HE

French

Irish

The Circulatory Sytem

Anaemia

ER, IR and RE verbs

Daily routine in the present 
tense

Science

English 

French 

Physics

Food and Digestion

Revise language features/
Writer’s craft

Describe your house and 
bedroom in detail

Light topic from Yr.9

English

French

Chemistry

Strategies for building rapport

Prepositions

Sect B: Elements, Compounds 
& Mixtures, Balancing 
Equations and Acids, Bases 
and Salts

English 

French 

Gaels

Spelling, punctuation and-
Grammar

Etre, avoir, faire and aller 
Pouvoir, devoir and vouloir

Accommodation, activites, 
shopping and eating out

Spanish

History

Maths L7 

Gaels

My interests (Somos así)

C20th overview

Number Forms (Binary and 
Standard Form)

Holidays, destinations, 
transport

HE

History

Maths L7 
 

Physics

CHD

The Road to the Holocaust

Distance Speed Time 
and Density (Compound 
Measures)

Electricty & Magnetism

HE

History 

Maths L7 

Physics

Osteoporosis

Studying sources - 
comprehension questions

Approximating and Estimating, 
Limits and Boundaries

Forces

Chemistry

HE

French 

Gaels

Section B Topics

Practical skills and routines

Sport: likes & dislikes, 
importance of sport

Social and global issues

History 

Maths M1 
M2

Gaels

Source Skills - answering the 
How Useful Question (CLAD) 

Angles 

Community involvement

Physics

Maths L7 

French 

Irish

Forces

Similarity Congruence and the 
Effects of Enlargement

Talking about sport in the 
easy future tense

Reading and writing paper




